
 ARFQ DEP2500000045 
SULLIVAN REFUSE AND 

CLOGGED STREAM 
LINE     BAAM CONTRACTING LLC        EASTERN ARROW CORP INC        MASON DIXON ENERGY SERVICES LLC        WEST BROTHERS CONTRACTING INC        ASPEN BUILDERS INC   

   
  1 17,488.00$                                                     15,000.00$                                                           19,667.94$                                                                                   16,596.75$                                                                                29,000.00$                                           
  2 10,000.00$                                                     4,993.00$                                                              19,667.94$                                                                                   16,596.75$                                                                                29,000.00$                                           
  3 5,000.00$                                                        1,000.00$                                                              13,111.96$                                                                                   11,064.50$                                                                                19,000.00$                                           
  4 29,000.00$                                                     37,000.00$                                                           32,779.90$                                                                                   27,661.25$                                                                                48,500.00$                                           
  5 33,000.00$                                                     53,600.00$                                                           24,000.00$                                                                                   40,000.00$                                                                                32,000.00$                                           
  6 2,400.00$                                                        1,200.00$                                                              2,340.00$                                                                                      3,600.00$                                                                                   1,200.00$                                              
  7 17,900.00$                                                     15,000.00$                                                           19,667.94$                                                                                   16,596.75$                                                                                29,000.00$                                           
  8 6,000.00$                                                        7,200.00$                                                              4,800.00$                                                                                      3,000.00$                                                                                   4,800.00$                                              
  9 1,375.00$                                                        1,675.00$                                                              5,625.00$                                                                                      1,250.00$                                                                                   1,875.00$                                              

  10 7,200.00$                                                        1,800.00$                                                              5,700.00$                                                                                      2,700.00$                                                                                   18,000.00$                                           
  11 56,000.00$                                                     25,160.00$                                                           60,000.00$                                                                                   63,000.00$                                                                                40,000.00$                                           
  12 32,900.00$                                                     38,500.00$                                                           42,000.00$                                                                                   49,000.00$                                                                                35,000.00$                                           
  13 10,450.00$                                                     20,520.00$                                                           12,160.00$                                                                                   15,200.00$                                                                                13,300.00$                                           
  14 10,000.00$                                                     6,700.00$                                                              20,000.00$                                                                                   8,000.00$                                                                                   15,000.00$                                           
  15 33,500.00$                                                     5,000.00$                                                              25,000.00$                                                                                   22,500.00$                                                                                57,500.00$                                           
  16 103,312.50$                                                  106,875.00$                                                        114,000.00$                                                                                121,125.00$                                                                              171,000.00$                                        
  17 57,600.00$                                                     232,248.00$                                                        45,000.00$                                                                                   48,000.00$                                                                                48,000.00$                                           
  18 10,416.00$                                                     3,360.00$                                                              20,160.00$                                                                                   16,800.00$                                                                                10,080.00$                                           
  19 29,400.00$                                                     9,000.00$                                                              42,000.00$                                                                                   33,000.00$                                                                                36,000.00$                                           
  20 1,250.00$                                                        1,250.00$                                                              250.00$                                                                                          1,250.00$                                                                                   1,875.00$                                              
  21 4,500.00$                                                        1,500.00$                                                              15,000.00$                                                                                   4,500.00$                                                                                   6,000.00$                                              
  22 15,500.00$                                                     20,000.00$                                                           19,667.94$                                                                                   16,596.75$                                                                                29,000.00$                                           
  23 46,410.00$                                                     19,125.00$                                                           38,250.00$                                                                                   51,000.00$                                                                                15,300.00$                                           
  24 40,800.00$                                                     71,400.00$                                                           40,800.00$                                                                                   40,800.00$                                                                                24,480.00$                                           
  25 4,500.00$                                                        3,900.00$                                                              2,035.00$                                                                                      2,500.00$                                                                                   12,500.00$                                           
  26 5,500.00$                                                        4,400.00$                                                              2,200.38$                                                                                      2,500.00$                                                                                   15,000.00$                                           
  27 10,200.00$                                                     10,800.00$                                                           4,500.00$                                                                                      6,000.00$                                                                                   37,500.00$                                           
  28 9,000.00$                                                        9,800.00$                                                              1,680.00$                                                                                      5,000.00$                                                                                   30,000.00$                                           
  29 7,000.00$                                                        10,000.00$                                                           834.00$                                                                                          5,000.00$                                                                                   50,000.00$                                           
  30 13,500.00$                                                     15,000.00$                                                           2,700.00$                                                                                      7,500.00$                                                                                   120,000.00$                                        
  31 -$                                                                    -$                                                                          NO BID NO BID NO BID

   Total For Default Commodity Group    631,101.50$                                                  753,006.00$                                                        NO BID NO BID NO BID
  Total Bid   631,101.50$                                                  753,006.00$                                                        655,598.00$                                                                                658,337.75$                                                                              979,910.00$                                        


